
EXPOSURE DRAFT  

  

EXPOSURE DRAFT  

  

 

 

 

1 

   

EXPOSURE DRAFT 
 

 1 

Inserts for 2 

Tax and Superannuation Laws 3 

Amendment (2014 Measures No. 2) Bill 4 

2014: lost member small account 5 

threshold 6 

 7 

 8 

Commencement information 

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 

Provision(s) Commencement Date/Details 

1.     

2.  Schedule ??, 

item 1 

31 December 2015. 31 December 

2015 

3.  Schedule ??, 

item 2 

31 December 2016. 31 December 

2016 



EXPOSURE DRAFT  

  

EXPOSURE DRAFT  

  

 

 

 

2 

   

Schedule ??—Lost member small account 1 

threshold 2 

   3 

Superannuation (Unclaimed Money and Lost Members) Act 4 

1999 5 

1  Paragraph 24B(1)(b) 6 

Omit “$2,000”, substitute “$4,000”. 7 

2  Paragraph 24B(1)(b) 8 

Omit “$4,000”, substitute “$6,000”. 9 


	opcAmSched
	opcCurrentFind

